

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
GRADING									
12	GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL								
	11690.0000	TON	8.0000	5.6000	-30.00 %	5.5000	-31.25 %	9.0000	12.50 %
			93,520.00	65,464.00	-28,056.00	64,295.00	-29,225.00	105,210.00	11,690.00
13	EMBANKMENT COMPACTION								
	18289.0000	C.Y.	2.5000	0.8400	-66.40 %	1.0000	-60.00 %	2.0000	-20.00 %
			45,722.50	15,362.76	-30,359.74	18,289.00	-27,433.50	36,578.00	-9,144.50
14	SUB EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL								
	950.0000	C.Y.	4.5000	4.3500	-3.33 %	7.5000	66.67 %	6.0000	33.33 %
			4,275.00	4,132.50	-142.50	7,125.00	2,850.00	5,700.00	1,425.00
15	COMMON BORROW FOR POND INCL HAUL								
	150.0000	C.Y.	17.0000	6.4000	-62.35 %	3.0000	-82.35 %	8.0000	-52.94 %
			2,550.00	960.00	-1,590.00	450.00	-2,100.00	1,200.00	-1,350.00
16	SPECIAL QUARRY ROCK								
	1900.0000	TON	20.0000	12.2500	-38.75 %	15.6500	-21.75 %	25.0000	25.00 %
			38,000.00	23,275.00	-14,725.00	29,735.00	-8,265.00	47,500.00	9,500.00
DRAINAGE									
17	SPECIAL GRAVEL BACKFILL								
	30.0000	TON	50.0000	20.5000	-59.00 %	50.0000	0.00 %	40.0000	-20.00 %
			1,500.00	615.00	-885.00	1,500.00	0.00	1,200.00	-300.00
18	POND EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL								
	320.0000	C.Y.	10.0000	6.4000	-36.00 %	7.5000	-25.00 %	10.0000	0.00 %
			3,200.00	2,048.00	-1,152.00	2,400.00	-800.00	3,200.00	0.00
19	GRATE INLET TYPE 2								
	3.0000	EACH	1,600.0000	1,510.0000	-5.63 %	1,850.0000	15.63 %	2,000.0000	25.00 %
			4,800.00	4,530.00	-270.00	5,550.00	750.00	6,000.00	1,200.00
20	HAND PLACED RIPRAP								
	26.0000	C.Y.	50.0000	62.5000	25.00 %	100.0000	100.00 %	100.0000	100.00 %
			1,300.00	1,625.00	325.00	2,600.00	1,300.00	2,600.00	1,300.00
21	UNDERDRAIN PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.								
	180.0000	L.F.	13.0000	9.5000	-26.92 %	13.5000	3.85 %	10.0000	-23.08 %
			2,340.00	1,710.00	-630.00	2,430.00	90.00	1,800.00	-540.00
22	SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 12 IN. DIAM.								
	334.0000	L.F.	25.0000	11.3500	-54.60 %	24.5000	-2.00 %	16.0000	-36.00 %
			8,350.00	3,790.90	-4,559.10	8,183.00	-167.00	5,344.00	-3,006.00

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
DRAINAGE										
23	SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 18 IN. DIAM.									
	243.0000	L.F.	30.0000	16.5000	-45.00 %	32.0000	6.67 %	25.0000	-16.67 %	
			7,290.00	4,009.50	-3,280.50	7,776.00	486.00	6,075.00	-1,215.00	
24	TEMPORARY CULVERT 48 IN. DIAM.									
	200.0000	L.F.	40.0000	44.5000	11.25 %	60.0000	50.00 %	40.0000	0.00 %	
			8,000.00	8,900.00	900.00	12,000.00	4,000.00	8,000.00	0.00	
25	MULTIPLE ORIFICE STRUCTURE									
		L.S.			-54.60 %		-40.00 %		-36.00 %	
			2,500.00	1,135.00	-1,365.00	1,500.00	-1,000.00	1,600.00	-900.00	
STRUCTURE										
26	STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL									
	214.0000	C.Y.	25.0000	8.2000	-67.20 %	10.5000	-58.00 %	20.0000	-20.00 %	
			5,350.00	1,754.80	-3,595.20	2,247.00	-3,103.00	4,280.00	-1,070.00	
27	SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A									
		L.S.			-99.99 %		-30.00 %		-50.00 %	
			10,000.00	1.00	-9,999.00	7,000.00	-3,000.00	5,000.00	-5,000.00	
28	GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL									
	75.0000	C.Y.	45.0000	22.2500	-50.56 %	50.0000	11.11 %	40.0000	-11.11 %	
			3,375.00	1,668.75	-1,706.25	3,750.00	375.00	3,000.00	-375.00	
29	SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCL. HAUL									
	350.0000	C.Y.	300.0000	254.0000	-15.33 %	435.0000	45.00 %	300.0000	0.00 %	
			105,000.00	88,900.00	-16,100.00	152,250.00	47,250.00	105,000.00	0.00	
30	FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT									
	70.0000	L.F.	100.0000	50.0000	-50.00 %	50.0000	-50.00 %	100.0000	0.00 %	
			7,000.00	3,500.00	-3,500.00	3,500.00	-3,500.00	7,000.00	0.00	
31	FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT									
	30.0000	L.F.	350.0000	860.0000	145.71 %	886.0000	153.14 %	1,000.0000	185.71 %	
			10,500.00	25,800.00	15,300.00	26,580.00	16,080.00	30,000.00	19,500.00	
32	PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT									
	2.0000	EACH	1,000.0000	6,400.0000	540.00 %	6,750.0000	575.00 %	7,000.0000	600.00 %	
			2,000.00	12,800.00	10,800.00	13,500.00	11,500.00	14,000.00	12,000.00	
33	CASING SHORING									
	45.0000	L.F.	300.0000	1,100.0000	266.67 %	1,135.0000	278.33 %	1,200.0000	300.00 %	
			13,500.00	49,500.00	36,000.00	51,075.00	37,575.00	54,000.00	40,500.00	

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
STRUCTURE									
34	SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A FOR SHAFT	L.S.			110.00 %		275.00 %		400.00 %
			2,000.00	4,200.00	2,200.00	7,500.00	5,500.00	10,000.00	8,000.00
35	CONC. CLASS 4000P FOR SHAFT	C.Y.	204.0000	125.0000	300.0000	140.00 %	310.0000	148.00 %	300.0000
			25,500.00	61,200.00	35,700.00	63,240.00	37,740.00	61,200.00	35,700.00
36	CSL ACCESS TUBE	L.F.	666.0000	2.0000	3.5000	75.00 %	3.6500	82.50 %	4.0000
			1,332.00	2,331.00	999.00	2,430.90	1,098.90	2,664.00	1,332.00
37	ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT	LB.	27200.0000	0.5000	0.6500	30.00 %	0.6800	36.00 %	0.6000
			13,600.00	17,680.00	4,080.00	18,496.00	4,896.00	16,320.00	2,720.00
38	ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE	LB.	40000.0000	1.1000	0.6500	-40.91 %	0.6800	-38.18 %	0.6000
			44,000.00	26,000.00	-18,000.00	27,200.00	-16,800.00	24,000.00	-20,000.00
39	ST. REINF. BAR FOR WALL	LB.	3500.0000	0.5000	0.6500	30.00 %	0.6800	36.00 %	0.6000
			1,750.00	2,275.00	525.00	2,380.00	630.00	2,100.00	350.00
40	CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR WALL	C.Y.	75.0000	350.0000	650.0000	85.71 %	685.0000	95.71 %	400.0000
			26,250.00	48,750.00	22,500.00	51,375.00	25,125.00	30,000.00	3,750.00
41	DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT	CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			1.00	1.00		1.00		1.00	
42	CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR BRIDGE	C.Y.	148.0000	500.0000	575.0000	15.00 %	595.0000	19.00 %	400.0000
			74,000.00	85,100.00	11,100.00	88,060.00	14,060.00	59,200.00	-14,800.00
43	CONDUIT PIPE 2 IN. DIAM.	L.F.	916.0000	10.0000	4.2500	-57.50 %	4.5500	-54.50 %	4.0000
			9,160.00	3,893.00	-5,267.00	4,167.80	-4,992.20	3,664.00	-5,496.00
44	TRAFFIC BARRIER	L.F.	458.0000	70.0000	110.0000	57.14 %	117.5000	67.86 %	90.0000
			32,060.00	50,380.00	18,320.00	53,815.00	21,755.00	41,220.00	9,160.00
45	STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL	L.S.			2,017.20 %		2,130.77 %		130.77 %
			6,500.00	137,618.00	131,118.00	145,000.00	138,500.00	15,000.00	8,500.00

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
STRUCTURE									
46	STRUCTURAL LOW ALLOY STEEL	L.S.			587.19 %			608.44 %	56.25 %
			16,000.00	109,950.00	93,950.00	113,350.00	97,350.00	25,000.00	9,000.00
47	STRUCTURAL HIGH STRENGTH STEEL	L.S.			-63.33 %			-60.88 %	5.26 %
			285,000.00	104,518.00	-180,482.00	111,500.00	-173,500.00	300,000.00	15,000.00
48	FORCE ACCOUNT REMOVING OBSTRUCTIONS	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %	0.00 %
			18,000.00	18,000.00		18,000.00		18,000.00	
SURFACING									
49	CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE								
	5420.0000	TON	16.0000	15.5000	-3.13 %	15.8000	-1.25 %	17.0000	6.25 %
			86,720.00	84,010.00	-2,710.00	85,636.00	-1,084.00	92,140.00	5,420.00
LIQUID ASPHALT									
50	ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %	0.00 %
			3,730.00	3,730.00		3,730.00		3,730.00	
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT									
51	BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB	S.Y.			-31.18 %			-29.06 %	5.88 %
	188.0000		170.0000	117.0000	-9,964.00	120.6000	-9,287.20	180.0000	1,880.00
			31,960.00	21,996.00		22,672.80		33,840.00	
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT									
52	PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT	S.Y.			-30.00 %			66.67 %	66.67 %
	240.0000		6.0000	4.2000	-432.00	10.0000	960.00	10.0000	960.00
			1,440.00	1,008.00		2,400.00		2,400.00	
53	ASPHALT CONC. FOR PRELEVELING CL. A PG 58-22	TON			58.33 %			58.33 %	66.67 %
	20.0000		60.0000	95.0000	700.00	95.0000	700.00	100.0000	800.00
			1,200.00	1,900.00		1,900.00		2,000.00	

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT									
54	ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A	PG 58-22							
	6430.0000	TON	60.0000	70.0000	16.67 %	65.5000	9.17 %	70.0000	16.67 %
			385,800.00	450,100.00	64,300.00	421,165.00	35,365.00	450,100.00	64,300.00
55	JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT								
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			11,574.00	11,574.00		11,574.00		11,574.00	
56	COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT								
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			4,870.00	4,870.00		4,870.00		4,870.00	
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING									
57	SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING								
	7.0000	ACRE	1,000.0000	795.0000	-20.50 %	825.0000	-17.50 %	1,000.0000	0.00 %
			7,000.00	5,565.00	-1,435.00	5,775.00	-1,225.00	7,000.00	0.00
58	LIMING								
	7.0000	ACRE	150.0000	210.0000	40.00 %	450.0000	200.00 %	400.0000	166.67 %
			1,050.00	1,470.00	420.00	3,150.00	2,100.00	2,800.00	1,750.00
59	SILT FENCE								
	2700.0000	L.F.	3.0000	3.1500	5.00 %	3.3000	10.00 %	2.0000	-33.33 %
			8,100.00	8,505.00	405.00	8,910.00	810.00	5,400.00	-2,700.00
60	EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL								
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			50,000.00	50,000.00		50,000.00		50,000.00	
61	STRAW MULCH BLANKET								
	2.5000	ACRE	2,840.0000	2,070.0000	-27.11 %	1,100.0000	-61.27 %	1,000.0000	-64.79 %
			7,100.00	5,175.00	-1,925.00	2,750.00	-4,350.00	2,500.00	-4,600.00
TRAFFIC									
62	EXTRUDED CURB								
	221.0000	L.F.	9.0000	8.0000	-11.11 %	4.7500	-47.22 %	6.0000	-33.33 %
			1,989.00	1,768.00	-221.00	1,049.75	-939.25	1,326.00	-663.00
63	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 9 FT. LONG POST								
	713.0000	L.F.	15.0000	15.5000	3.33 %	15.5000	3.33 %	16.0000	6.67 %
			10,695.00	11,051.50	356.50	11,051.50	356.50	11,408.00	713.00

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
TRAFFIC										
64	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1									
	627.0000	L.F.	14.0000	13.0000	-7.14 %	13.6500	-2.50 %	14.0000	0.00 %	
			8,778.00	8,151.00	-627.00	8,558.55	-219.45	8,778.00	0.00	
65	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1									
	4.0000	EACH	1,300.0000	1,200.0000	-7.69 %	1,265.0000	-2.69 %	1,500.0000	15.38 %	
			5,200.00	4,800.00	-400.00	5,060.00	-140.00	6,000.00	800.00	
66	BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL									
	3.0000	EACH	1,900.0000	1,735.0000	-8.68 %	1,830.0000	-3.68 %	2,000.0000	5.26 %	
			5,700.00	5,205.00	-495.00	5,490.00	-210.00	6,000.00	300.00	
67	BEAM GUARDRAIL BURIED TERMINAL TYPE 2									
	5.0000	L.F.	1,000.0000	740.0000	-26.00 %	780.0000	-22.00 %	800.0000	-20.00 %	
			5,000.00	3,700.00	-1,300.00	3,900.00	-1,100.00	4,000.00	-1,000.00	
68	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST									
	60.0000	EACH	25.0000	22.0000	-12.00 %	23.5000	-6.00 %	25.0000	0.00 %	
			1,500.00	1,320.00	-180.00	1,410.00	-90.00	1,500.00	0.00	
69	PAINT LINE									
	11550.0000	L.F.	0.2500	0.1600	-36.00 %	0.1200	-52.00 %	0.1600	-36.00 %	
			2,887.50	1,848.00	-1,039.50	1,386.00	-1,501.50	1,848.00	-1,039.50	
70	PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING									
	6.0000	EACH	25.0000	50.0000	100.00 %	95.0000	280.00 %	50.0000	100.00 %	
			150.00	300.00	150.00	570.00	420.00	300.00	150.00	
71	RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 2									
	1.1000	HUND	600.0000	890.0000	48.33 %	845.0000	40.83 %	1,000.0000	66.67 %	
			660.00	979.00	319.00	929.50	269.50	1,100.00	440.00	
72	TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING									
	15400.0000	L.F.	0.1200	0.1600	33.33 %	0.0700	-41.67 %	0.1000	-16.67 %	
			1,848.00	2,464.00	616.00	1,078.00	-770.00	1,540.00	-308.00	
73	PERMANENT SIGNING									
		L.S.			25.00 %		-32.95 %		-9.09 %	
			2,200.00	2,750.00	550.00	1,475.00	-725.00	2,000.00	-200.00	
74	TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES									
		L.S.			-38.27 %		85.19 %		-25.93 %	
			8,100.00	5,000.00	-3,100.00	15,000.00	6,900.00	6,000.00	-2,100.00	
75	TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR									
	4440.0000	HR	35.0000	40.0000	14.29 %	33.5000	-4.29 %	35.0000	0.00 %	
			155,400.00	177,600.00	22,200.00	148,740.00	-6,660.00	155,400.00	0.00	

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
TRAFFIC										
76	TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR	HR	36.0000	40.0000	11.11 %	34.5000	-4.17 %	35.0000	-2.78 %	
	2220.0000		79,920.00	88,800.00	8,880.00	76,590.00	-3,330.00	77,700.00	-2,220.00	
77	CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A	S.F.	11.0000	18.0000	63.64 %	15.0000	36.36 %	20.0000	81.82 %	
	440.0000		4,840.00	7,920.00	3,080.00	6,600.00	1,760.00	8,800.00	3,960.00	
OTHER ITEMS										
78	STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL	C.Y.	30.0000	8.2000	-72.67 %	6.0000	-80.00 %	10.0000	-66.67 %	
	223.0000		6,690.00	1,828.60	-4,861.40	1,338.00	-5,352.00	2,230.00	-4,460.00	
79	STRUCTURE SURVEYING	L.S.			-72.00 %		-86.10 %		-60.00 %	
			50,000.00	14,000.00	-36,000.00	6,950.00	-43,050.00	20,000.00	-30,000.00	
80	ROADWAY SURVEYING	L.S.			-53.80 %		-63.70 %		-56.00 %	
			50,000.00	23,100.00	-26,900.00	18,150.00	-31,850.00	22,000.00	-28,000.00	
81	GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN	C.Y.	40.0000	32.0000	-20.00 %	50.0000	25.00 %	50.0000	25.00 %	
	14.0000		560.00	448.00	-112.00	700.00	140.00	700.00	140.00	
82	TRAINING	HR	10.0000	3.0000	-70.00 %	1.5000	-85.00 %	2.0000	-80.00 %	
	2000.0000		20,000.00	6,000.00	-14,000.00	3,000.00	-17,000.00	4,000.00	-16,000.00	
83	ROADSIDE CLEANUP	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			10,000.00	10,000.00		10,000.00		10,000.00		
84	TRIMMING AND CLEANUP	L.S.			147.14 %		42.86 %		14.29 %	
			3,500.00	8,650.00	5,150.00	5,000.00	1,500.00	4,000.00	500.00	
85	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			5.00	5.00		5.00		5.00		
86	MINOR CHANGE	CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			-3.00	-3.00		-3.00		-3.00		

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER		
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT				
OTHER ITEMS											
87	SPCC PLAN	L.S.			-48.75 %			-37.50 %		-62.50 %	
			4,000.00	2,050.00	-1,950.00	2,500.00	-1,500.00	1,500.00	-2,500.00		
88	FIELD OFFICE BUILDING	L.S.			-59.67 %			-30.00 %		-33.33 %	
			15,000.00	6,050.00	-8,950.00	10,500.00	-4,500.00	10,000.00	-5,000.00		
89	CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL	S.Y.			-85.75 %			-83.75 %		-85.00 %	
	400.0000		20.0000	2.8500	-6,860.00	3.2500	-6,700.00	3.0000	-6,800.00		
90	TEMPORARY EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL (TESC) PLAN	L.S.			-73.75 %			-50.00 %		-50.00 %	
			4,000.00	1,050.00	-2,950.00	2,000.00	-2,000.00	2,000.00	-2,000.00		
91	ESC LEAD	DAY			-47.92 %			-16.67 %		-16.67 %	
	50.0000		240.0000	125.0000	-5,750.00	200.0000	-2,000.00	200.0000	-2,000.00		
92	REMOVING AND PLACING TREES	EACH			213.33 %			-16.67 %		33.33 %	
	30.0000		150.0000	470.0000	9,600.00	125.0000	-750.00	200.0000	1,500.00		
93	CHAINING AND SECURING TREES	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %		0.00 %	
			4,500.00	4,500.00		4,500.00		4,500.00			
94	FURNISHING AND DRIVING PILES FOR ENGINEERED LOGJAM	L.F.			25.00 %			72.50 %		225.00 %	
	180.0000		20.0000	25.0000	900.00	34.5000	2,610.00	65.0000	8,100.00		
95	FORCE ACCOUNT STREAM DIVERSION	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %		0.00 %	
			2,000.00	2,000.00		2,000.00		2,000.00			
96	TEMPORARY ECOLOGY BLOCKS	EACH			-55.00 %			-62.50 %		-50.00 %	
	40.0000		200.0000	90.0000	-4,400.00	75.0000	-5,000.00	100.0000	-4,000.00		
97	SITE PRESERVATION ZONE - CONSTRUCTION FENCE	L.F.			6.25 %			12.50 %		-25.00 %	
	520.0000		4.0000	4.2500	130.00	4.5000	260.00	3.0000	-520.00		
98	ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL - AREA A	C.Y.			-50.60 %			-75.00 %		-20.00 %	
	10670.0000		2,080.00	2,210.00	-26,995.10	2,340.00	-40,012.50	1,560.00	-10,670.00		
			53,350.00	26,354.90		13,337.50		42,680.00			

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	LOW BIDDER	-----	-----	2ND BIDDER	-----	-----	3RD BIDDER	-----
	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES WA 983639458 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100122			KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 MUKILTEO WA 982750158 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100310			ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		2ND BIDDER		3RD BIDDER		
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
OTHER ITEMS									
99	ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL - AREA B								
	157845.0000	C.Y.	5.0000	3.9600	-20.80 %	4.0500	-19.00 %	4.0000	-20.00 %
			789,225.00	625,066.20	-164,158.80	639,272.25	-149,952.75	631,380.00	-157,845.00
	BASE TOTAL		\$3,175,099.00	\$3,095,515.91	-2.51 %	\$3,125,358.05	-1.57 %	\$3,304,776.00	4.08 %
ALTERNATE A1									
100	ROADWAY DECK - CAST IN PLACE ALTERNATE								
		L.S.			11.73 %		14.29 %		57.14 %
			140,000.00	156,428.00	16,428.00	160,000.00	20,000.00	220,000.00	80,000.00
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		\$140,000.00	\$156,428.00	11.73 %	\$160,000.00	14.29 %	\$220,000.00	57.14 %
ALTERNATE A2									
101	ROADWAY DECK - PRECAST DECK PANELS ALTERNATE								
		L.S.			-100.00 %		78.57 %		-100.00 %
			140,000.00	0.00	-140,000.00	250,000.00	110,000.00	0.00	-140,000.00
	ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL		\$140,000.00	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		\$250,000.00	78.57 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE TOTAL		\$3,175,099.00	\$3,095,515.91	-2.51 %	\$3,125,358.05	-1.57 %	\$3,304,776.00	4.08 %
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		\$3,315,099.00	\$3,251,943.91	-1.91 %	\$3,285,358.05	-0.90 %	\$3,524,776.00	6.32 %
	BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		\$3,315,099.00	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		\$3,375,358.05	1.82 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	

NOTE : ALL BIDS REJECTED

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER	6TH BIDDER
SCARSELLA BROS. INC. 19460 84TH AVE S KENT WA 98032-1240 SEATTLE WA 981680697 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000	DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC. 4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD 98363 PORT ANGELES WA 983620210 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 216500	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT WA 982011927 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
GRADING									
12	GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL								
	11690.0000	TON	8.0000	5.2500	-34.38 %	8.2000	2.50 %	7.5000	-6.25 %
			93,520.00	61,372.50	-32,147.50	95,858.00	2,338.00	87,675.00	-5,845.00
13	EMBANKMENT COMPACTION								
	18289.0000	C.Y.	2.5000	1.2500	-50.00 %	0.7500	-70.00 %	1.0000	-60.00 %
			45,722.50	22,861.25	-22,861.25	13,716.75	-32,005.75	18,289.00	-27,433.50
14	SUB EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL								
	950.0000	C.Y.	4.5000	5.6000	24.44 %	7.5000	66.67 %	20.0000	344.44 %
			4,275.00	5,320.00	1,045.00	7,125.00	2,850.00	19,000.00	14,725.00
15	COMMON BORROW FOR POND INCL HAUL								
	150.0000	C.Y.	17.0000	3.0000	-82.35 %	10.0000	-41.18 %	27.0000	58.82 %
			2,550.00	450.00	-2,100.00	1,500.00	-1,050.00	4,050.00	1,500.00
16	SPECIAL QUARRY ROCK								
	1900.0000	TON	20.0000	15.0000	-25.00 %	13.0000	-35.00 %	20.0000	0.00 %
			38,000.00	28,500.00	-9,500.00	24,700.00	-13,300.00	38,000.00	0.00
DRAINAGE									
17	SPECIAL GRAVEL BACKFILL								
	30.0000	TON	50.0000	30.0000	-40.00 %	35.0000	-30.00 %	21.0000	-58.00 %
			1,500.00	900.00	-600.00	1,050.00	-450.00	630.00	-870.00
18	POND EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL								
	320.0000	C.Y.	10.0000	5.6000	-44.00 %	8.0000	-20.00 %	25.0000	150.00 %
			3,200.00	1,792.00	-1,408.00	2,560.00	-640.00	8,000.00	4,800.00
19	GRATE INLET TYPE 2								
	3.0000	EACH	1,600.0000	2,000.0000	25.00 %	1,800.0000	12.50 %	2,600.0000	62.50 %
			4,800.00	6,000.00	1,200.00	5,400.00	600.00	7,800.00	3,000.00
20	HAND PLACED RIPRAP								
	26.0000	C.Y.	50.0000	50.0000	0.00 %	50.0000	0.00 %	65.0000	30.00 %
			1,300.00	1,300.00	0.00	1,300.00	0.00	1,690.00	390.00
21	UNDERDRAIN PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.								
	180.0000	L.F.	13.0000	12.0000	-7.69 %	13.0000	0.00 %	3.0000	-76.92 %
			2,340.00	2,160.00	-180.00	2,340.00	0.00	540.00	-1,800.00
22	SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 12 IN. DIAM.								
	334.0000	L.F.	25.0000	27.2000	8.80 %	15.0000	-40.00 %	50.0000	100.00 %
			8,350.00	9,084.80	734.80	5,010.00	-3,340.00	16,700.00	8,350.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	4TH BIDDER	-----	-----	5TH BIDDER	-----	-----	6TH BIDDER	-----
	SCARSELLA BROS. INC.			DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC.			WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
	19460 84TH AVE S			4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD			1525 E MARINE VIEW DR	
	KENT WA 98032-1240			98363				
	SEATTLE WA 981680697			PORT ANGELES WA 983620210			EVERETT WA 982011927	
	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	746000		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	216500		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
DRAINAGE									
23	SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 18 IN. DIAM.								
	243.0000	L.F.	30.0000	31.7500	5.83 %	20.0000	-33.33 %	55.0000	83.33 %
			7,290.00	7,715.25	425.25	4,860.00	-2,430.00	13,365.00	6,075.00
24	TEMPORARY CULVERT 48 IN. DIAM.								
	200.0000	L.F.	40.0000	50.0000	25.00 %	50.0000	25.00 %	85.0000	112.50 %
			8,000.00	10,000.00	2,000.00	10,000.00	2,000.00	17,000.00	9,000.00
25	MULTIPLE ORIFICE STRUCTURE								
		L.S.			-60.00 %		2.00 %		-16.00 %
			2,500.00	1,000.00	-1,500.00	2,550.00	50.00	2,100.00	-400.00
STRUCTURE									
26	STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL								
	214.0000	C.Y.	25.0000	20.0000	-20.00 %	20.0000	-20.00 %	17.0000	-32.00 %
			5,350.00	4,280.00	-1,070.00	4,280.00	-1,070.00	3,638.00	-1,712.00
27	SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A								
		L.S.			-80.00 %		-50.00 %		96.00 %
			10,000.00	2,000.00	-8,000.00	5,000.00	-5,000.00	19,600.00	9,600.00
28	GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL								
	75.0000	C.Y.	45.0000	35.0000	-22.22 %	40.0000	-11.11 %	24.0000	-46.67 %
			3,375.00	2,625.00	-750.00	3,000.00	-375.00	1,800.00	-1,575.00
29	SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCL. HAUL								
	350.0000	C.Y.	300.0000	240.0000	-20.00 %	252.0000	-16.00 %	350.0000	16.67 %
			105,000.00	84,000.00	-21,000.00	88,200.00	-16,800.00	122,500.00	17,500.00
30	FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT								
	70.0000	L.F.	100.0000	50.0000	-50.00 %	52.5000	-47.50 %	60.0000	-40.00 %
			7,000.00	3,500.00	-3,500.00	3,675.00	-3,325.00	4,200.00	-2,800.00
31	FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT								
	30.0000	L.F.	350.0000	860.0000	145.71 %	903.0000	158.00 %	1,000.0000	185.71 %
			10,500.00	25,800.00	15,300.00	27,090.00	16,590.00	30,000.00	19,500.00
32	PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 10 FT DIAM. SHAFT								
	2.0000	EACH	1,000.0000	6,400.0000	540.00 %	6,720.0000	572.00 %	7,400.0000	640.00 %
			2,000.00	12,800.00	10,800.00	13,440.00	11,440.00	14,800.00	12,800.00
33	CASING SHORING								
	45.0000	L.F.	300.0000	1,100.0000	266.67 %	1,155.0000	285.00 %	1,300.0000	333.33 %
			13,500.00	49,500.00	36,000.00	51,975.00	38,475.00	58,500.00	45,000.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER	6TH BIDDER
SCARSELLA BROS. INC. 19460 84TH AVE S KENT WA 98032-1240 SEATTLE WA 981680697 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000	DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC. 4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD 98363 PORT ANGELES WA 983620210 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 216500	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT WA 982011927 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
STRUCTURE									
34	SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A FOR SHAFT	L.S.			110.00 %		120.50 %		175.00 %
			2,000.00	4,200.00	2,200.00	4,410.00	2,410.00	5,500.00	3,500.00
35	CONC. CLASS 4000P FOR SHAFT	C.Y.	125.0000	250.0000	100.00 %	315.0000	152.00 %	350.0000	180.00 %
	204.0000		25,500.00	51,000.00	25,500.00	64,260.00	38,760.00	71,400.00	45,900.00
36	CSL ACCESS TUBE	L.F.	2.0000	5.0000	150.00 %	3.7000	85.00 %	3.0000	50.00 %
	666.0000		1,332.00	3,330.00	1,998.00	2,464.20	1,132.20	1,998.00	666.00
37	ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT	LB.	0.5000	0.5000	0.00 %	0.6800	36.00 %	0.6000	20.00 %
	27200.0000		13,600.00	13,600.00	0.00	18,496.00	4,896.00	16,320.00	2,720.00
38	ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE	LB.	1.1000	0.5000	-54.55 %	0.6800	-38.18 %	0.6000	-45.45 %
	40000.0000		44,000.00	20,000.00	-24,000.00	27,200.00	-16,800.00	24,000.00	-20,000.00
39	ST. REINF. BAR FOR WALL	LB.	0.5000	0.6000	20.00 %	0.6800	36.00 %	1.0000	100.00 %
	3500.0000		1,750.00	2,100.00	350.00	2,380.00	630.00	3,500.00	1,750.00
40	CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR WALL	C.Y.	350.0000	400.0000	14.29 %	682.5000	95.00 %	500.0000	42.86 %
	75.0000		26,250.00	30,000.00	3,750.00	51,187.50	24,937.50	37,500.00	11,250.00
41	DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT	CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			1.00	1.00		1.00		1.00	
42	CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR BRIDGE	C.Y.	500.0000	450.0000	-10.00 %	604.0000	20.80 %	310.0000	-38.00 %
	148.0000		74,000.00	66,600.00	-7,400.00	89,392.00	15,392.00	45,880.00	-28,120.00
43	CONDUIT PIPE 2 IN. DIAM.	L.F.	10.0000	5.0000	-50.00 %	4.4500	-55.50 %	25.0000	150.00 %
	916.0000		9,160.00	4,580.00	-4,580.00	4,076.20	-5,083.80	22,900.00	13,740.00
44	TRAFFIC BARRIER	L.F.	70.0000	65.0000	-7.14 %	115.5000	65.00 %	65.0000	-7.14 %
	458.0000		32,060.00	29,770.00	-2,290.00	52,899.00	20,839.00	29,770.00	-2,290.00
45	STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL	L.S.			0.00 %		2,123.08 %		23.08 %
			6,500.00	6,500.00	0.00	144,500.00	138,000.00	8,000.00	1,500.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	4TH BIDDER	-----	-----	5TH BIDDER	-----	-----	6TH BIDDER	-----
	SCARSELLA BROS. INC.			DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC.			WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
	19460 84TH AVE S			4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD			1525 E MARINE VIEW DR	
	KENT WA 98032-1240			98363				
	SEATTLE WA 981680697			PORT ANGELES WA 983620210			EVERETT WA 982011927	
	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	746000		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	216500		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
STRUCTURE									
46	STRUCTURAL LOW ALLOY STEEL	L.S.			50.00 %		622.19 %	66.25 %	
			16,000.00	24,000.00	8,000.00	115,550.00	99,550.00	26,600.00	10,600.00
47	STRUCTURAL HIGH STRENGTH STEEL	L.S.			5.26 %		-54.47 %	8.77 %	
			285,000.00	300,000.00	15,000.00	129,750.00	-155,250.00	310,000.00	25,000.00
48	FORCE ACCOUNT REMOVING OBSTRUCTIONS	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %	0.00 %	
			18,000.00	18,000.00		18,000.00		18,000.00	
SURFACING									
49	CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE								
	5420.0000	TON	16.0000	15.0000	-6.25 %	15.0000	-6.25 %	16.0000	0.00 %
			86,720.00	81,300.00	-5,420.00	81,300.00	-5,420.00	86,720.00	0.00
LIQUID ASPHALT									
50	ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %	0.00 %	
			3,730.00	3,730.00		3,730.00		3,730.00	
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT									
51	BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB	S.Y.			-5.88 %		-27.74 %	-5.88 %	
	188.0000		170.0000	160.0000	-5.88 %	122.8500	-27.74 %	160.0000	-5.88 %
			31,960.00	30,080.00	-1,880.00	23,095.80	-8,864.20	30,080.00	-1,880.00
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT									
52	PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT	S.Y.			33.33 %		108.33 %	-16.67 %	
	240.0000		6.0000	8.0000	33.33 %	12.5000	108.33 %	5.0000	-16.67 %
			1,440.00	1,920.00	480.00	3,000.00	1,560.00	1,200.00	-240.00
53	ASPHALT CONC. FOR PRELEVELING CL. A PG 58-22	TON			66.67 %		66.67 %	66.67 %	
	20.0000		60.0000	100.0000	66.67 %	100.0000	66.67 %	100.0000	66.67 %
			1,200.00	2,000.00	800.00	2,000.00	800.00	2,000.00	800.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

*** BID CHECK REPORT ***

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER	6TH BIDDER
SCARSELLA BROS. INC. 19460 84TH AVE S KENT WA 98032-1240 SEATTLE WA 981680697 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000	DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC. 4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD 98363 PORT ANGELES WA 983620210 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 216500	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT WA 982011927 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT				
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT											
54	ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A	PG 58-22									
	6430.0000	TON	60.0000	72.0000	20.00 %	73.0000	21.67 %	75.0000	25.00 %		
			385,800.00	462,960.00	77,160.00	469,390.00	83,590.00	482,250.00	96,450.00		
55	JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT										
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %		
			11,574.00	11,574.00		11,574.00		11,574.00			
56	COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT										
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %		
			4,870.00	4,870.00		4,870.00		4,870.00			
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING											
57	SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING										
	7.0000	ACRE	1,000.0000	950.0000	-5.00 %	850.0000	-15.00 %	850.0000	-15.00 %		
			7,000.00	6,650.00	-350.00	5,950.00	-1,050.00	5,950.00	-1,050.00		
58	LIMING										
	7.0000	ACRE	150.0000	250.0000	66.67 %	500.0000	233.33 %	120.0000	-20.00 %		
			1,050.00	1,750.00	700.00	3,500.00	2,450.00	840.00	-210.00		
59	SILT FENCE										
	2700.0000	L.F.	3.0000	5.0000	66.67 %	3.0000	0.00 %	4.0000	33.33 %		
			8,100.00	13,500.00	5,400.00	8,100.00	0.00	10,800.00	2,700.00		
60	EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL										
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %		
			50,000.00	50,000.00		50,000.00		50,000.00			
61	STRAW MULCH BLANKET										
	2.5000	ACRE	2,840.0000	2,000.0000	-29.58 %	1,200.0000	-57.75 %	1,700.0000	-40.14 %		
			7,100.00	5,000.00	-2,100.00	3,000.00	-4,100.00	4,250.00	-2,850.00		
TRAFFIC											
62	EXTRUDED CURB										
	221.0000	L.F.	9.0000	8.0000	-11.11 %	8.5000	-5.56 %	9.0000	0.00 %		
			1,989.00	1,768.00	-221.00	1,878.50	-110.50	1,989.00	0.00		
63	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 9 FT. LONG POST										
	713.0000	L.F.	15.0000	13.7500	-8.33 %	15.5000	3.33 %	18.0000	20.00 %		
			10,695.00	9,803.75	-891.25	11,051.50	356.50	12,834.00	2,139.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	4TH BIDDER	-----	5TH BIDDER	-----	6TH BIDDER	-----
	SCARSELLA BROS. INC.		DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC.		WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
	19460 84TH AVE S		4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD		1525 E MARINE VIEW DR	
	KENT WA 98032-1240		98363			
	SEATTLE WA 981680697		PORT ANGELES WA 983620210		EVERETT WA 982011927	
	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000		CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 216500		CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S EST.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
TRAFFIC										
64	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1									
	627.0000	L.F.	14.0000	11.7000	-16.43 %	13.5000	-3.57 %	18.0000	28.57 %	
			8,778.00	7,335.90	-1,442.10	8,464.50	-313.50	11,286.00	2,508.00	
65	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1									
	4.0000	EACH	1,300.0000	1,100.0000	-15.38 %	1,260.0000	-3.08 %	1,200.0000	-7.69 %	
			5,200.00	4,400.00	-800.00	5,040.00	-160.00	4,800.00	-400.00	
66	BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL									
	3.0000	EACH	1,900.0000	1,750.0000	-7.89 %	1,825.0000	-3.95 %	1,800.0000	-5.26 %	
			5,700.00	5,250.00	-450.00	5,475.00	-225.00	5,400.00	-300.00	
67	BEAM GUARDRAIL BURIED TERMINAL TYPE 2									
	5.0000	L.F.	1,000.0000	550.0000	-45.00 %	750.0000	-25.00 %	800.0000	-20.00 %	
			5,000.00	2,750.00	-2,250.00	3,750.00	-1,250.00	4,000.00	-1,000.00	
68	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST									
	60.0000	EACH	25.0000	18.5000	-26.00 %	23.0000	-8.00 %	29.0000	16.00 %	
			1,500.00	1,110.00	-390.00	1,380.00	-120.00	1,740.00	240.00	
69	PAINT LINE									
	11550.0000	L.F.	0.2500	0.1500	-40.00 %	0.1500	-40.00 %	0.2000	-20.00 %	
			2,887.50	1,732.50	-1,155.00	1,732.50	-1,155.00	2,310.00	-577.50	
70	PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING									
	6.0000	EACH	25.0000	55.0000	120.00 %	55.0000	120.00 %	94.0000	276.00 %	
			150.00	330.00	180.00	330.00	180.00	564.00	414.00	
71	RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 2									
	1.1000	HUND	600.0000	950.0000	58.33 %	935.0000	55.83 %	800.0000	33.33 %	
			660.00	1,045.00	385.00	1,028.50	368.50	880.00	220.00	
72	TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING									
	15400.0000	L.F.	0.1200	0.2000	66.67 %	0.1100	-8.33 %	0.1000	-16.67 %	
			1,848.00	3,080.00	1,232.00	1,694.00	-154.00	1,540.00	-308.00	
73	PERMANENT SIGNING									
		L.S.			-31.82 %		36.36 %		81.82 %	
			2,200.00	1,500.00	-700.00	3,000.00	800.00	4,000.00	1,800.00	
74	TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES									
		L.S.			-62.96 %		-35.19 %		-28.40 %	
			8,100.00	3,000.00	-5,100.00	5,250.00	-2,850.00	5,800.00	-2,300.00	
75	TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR									
	4440.0000	HR	35.0000	37.0000	5.71 %	40.0000	14.29 %	41.0000	17.14 %	
			155,400.00	164,280.00	8,880.00	177,600.00	22,200.00	182,040.00	26,640.00	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	4TH BIDDER	-----	-----	5TH BIDDER	-----	-----	6TH BIDDER	-----
	SCARSELLA BROS. INC.			DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC.			WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
	19460 84TH AVE S			4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD			1525 E MARINE VIEW DR	
	KENT WA 98032-1240			98363				
	SEATTLE WA 981680697			PORT ANGELES WA 983620210			EVERETT WA 982011927	
	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	746000		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	216500		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
TRAFFIC									
76	TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR	HR	36.0000	38.0000	5.56 %	40.0000	11.11 %	44.0000	22.22 %
	2220.0000		79,920.00	84,360.00	4,440.00	88,800.00	8,880.00	97,680.00	17,760.00
77	CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A	S.F.	11.0000	12.0000	9.09 %	20.0000	81.82 %	22.0000	100.00 %
	440.0000		4,840.00	5,280.00	440.00	8,800.00	3,960.00	9,680.00	4,840.00
OTHER ITEMS									
78	STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL	C.Y.	30.0000	10.0000	-66.67 %	10.0000	-66.67 %	19.0000	-36.67 %
	223.0000		6,690.00	2,230.00	-4,460.00	2,230.00	-4,460.00	4,237.00	-2,453.00
79	STRUCTURE SURVEYING	L.S.			-50.00 %		-62.00 %		-79.00 %
			50,000.00	25,000.00	-25,000.00	19,000.00	-31,000.00	10,500.00	-39,500.00
80	ROADWAY SURVEYING	L.S.			-60.00 %		-52.00 %		-60.00 %
			50,000.00	20,000.00	-30,000.00	24,000.00	-26,000.00	20,000.00	-30,000.00
81	GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN	C.Y.	40.0000	50.0000	25.00 %	20.0000	-50.00 %	52.0000	30.00 %
	14.0000		560.00	700.00	140.00	280.00	-280.00	728.00	168.00
82	TRAINING	HR	10.0000	2.0000	-80.00 %	1.0000	-90.00 %	1.0000	-90.00 %
	2000.0000		20,000.00	4,000.00	-16,000.00	2,000.00	-18,000.00	2,000.00	-18,000.00
83	ROADSIDE CLEANUP	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			10,000.00	10,000.00		10,000.00		10,000.00	
84	TRIMMING AND CLEANUP	L.S.			-28.57 %		-71.43 %		188.57 %
			3,500.00	2,500.00	-1,000.00	1,000.00	-2,500.00	10,100.00	6,600.00
85	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			5.00	5.00		5.00		5.00	
86	MINOR CHANGE	CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			-3.00	-3.00		-3.00		-3.00	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/11/2003

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:41

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

-----	4TH BIDDER	-----	-----	5TH BIDDER	-----	-----	6TH BIDDER	-----
	SCARSELLA BROS. INC.			DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC.			WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
	19460 84TH AVE S			4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD			1525 E MARINE VIEW DR	
	KENT WA 98032-1240			98363				
	SEATTLE WA 981680697			PORT ANGELES WA 983620210			EVERETT WA 982011927	
	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	746000		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	216500		CONTRACTOR NUMBER :	892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		
OTHER ITEMS									
87	SPCC PLAN	L.S.			-75.00 %			-75.00 %	-79.50 %
			4,000.00	1,000.00	-3,000.00	1,000.00	-3,000.00	820.00	-3,180.00
88	FIELD OFFICE BUILDING	L.S.			-66.67 %			-43.33 %	-12.67 %
			15,000.00	5,000.00	-10,000.00	8,500.00	-6,500.00	13,100.00	-1,900.00
89	CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL	S.Y.			-87.50 %			-87.50 %	-90.00 %
	400.0000		20.0000	2.5000	-7,000.00	1,000.00	-7,000.00	800.00	-7,200.00
90	TEMPORARY EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL (TESC) PLAN	L.S.			-75.00 %			-75.00 %	-79.50 %
			4,000.00	1,000.00	-3,000.00	1,000.00	-3,000.00	820.00	-3,180.00
91	ESC LEAD	DAY			-37.50 %			66.67 %	-41.67 %
	50.0000		240.0000	150.0000	-4,500.00	20,000.00	8,000.00	7,000.00	-5,000.00
92	REMOVING AND PLACING TREES	EACH			166.67 %			233.33 %	486.67 %
	30.0000		150.0000	400.0000	7,500.00	15,000.00	10,500.00	26,400.00	21,900.00
93	CHAINING AND SECURING TREES	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %	0.00 %
			4,500.00	4,500.00		4,500.00		4,500.00	
94	FURNISHING AND DRIVING PILES FOR ENGINEERED LOGJAM	L.F.			0.00 %			150.00 %	225.00 %
	180.0000		20.0000	20.0000	0.00	9,000.00	5,400.00	11,700.00	8,100.00
95	FORCE ACCOUNT STREAM DIVERSION	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %	0.00 %
			2,000.00	2,000.00		2,000.00		2,000.00	
96	TEMPORARY ECOLOGY BLOCKS	EACH			-25.00 %			-37.50 %	15.00 %
	40.0000		200.0000	150.0000	-2,000.00	5,000.00	-3,000.00	9,200.00	1,200.00
97	SITE PRESERVATION ZONE - CONSTRUCTION FENCE	L.F.			-25.00 %			-50.00 %	-50.00 %
	520.0000		4.0000	3.0000	-1,040.00	1,040.00	-1,040.00	1,040.00	-1,040.00
98	ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL - AREA A	C.Y.			-20.00 %			-30.00 %	-30.00 %
	10670.0000		5.0000	4.0000	53,350.00	42,680.00	-10,670.00	37,345.00	-16,005.00

PS&E JOB NO : 00C514 REVISION NO : 1
 CONTRACT NO : 006551 REGION NO : 3
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : XL1197
 HWY : SR 101
 TITLE : US 101
 NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
 AND REALIGNMENT
 00C514
 PROJECT : ER-0001(104)
 COUNTY(S) : JEFFERSON

BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
 ALL BIDS REJECTED : May 1 2003

4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER	6TH BIDDER
SCARSELLA BROS. INC. 19460 84TH AVE S KENT WA 98032-1240 SEATTLE WA 981680697	DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC. 4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD 98363 PORT ANGELES WA 983620210	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT WA 982011927
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 216500	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		4TH BIDDER		5TH BIDDER		6TH BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.		
OTHER ITEMS										
99	ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL - AREA B									
	157845.0000	C.Y.	5.0000	7.00 %	5.3500	7.00 %	4.9300	-1.40 %	5.5000	10.00 %
			789,225.00	55,245.75	844,470.75	55,245.75	778,175.85	-11,049.15	868,147.50	78,922.50
	BASE TOTAL		\$3,175,099.00	6.07 %	\$3,367,701.20	6.07 %	\$3,513,941.05	10.67 %	\$3,703,000.00	16.63 %
ALTERNATE A1										
100	ROADWAY DECK - CAST IN PLACE ALTERNATE									
		L.S.		35.71 %		35.71 %		17.32 %		35.71 %
			140,000.00	50,000.00	190,000.00	50,000.00	164,250.00	24,250.00	190,000.00	50,000.00
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		\$140,000.00	35.71 %	\$190,000.00	35.71 %	\$164,250.00	17.32 %	\$190,000.00	35.71 %
ALTERNATE A2										
101	ROADWAY DECK - PRECAST DECK PANELS ALTERNATE									
		L.S.		-100.00 %		-100.00 %		-100.00 %		114.29 %
			140,000.00	-140,000.00	0.00	-140,000.00	0.00	-140,000.00	300,000.00	160,000.00
	ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL		\$140,000.00	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	\$300,000.00	114.29 %
BASE TOTAL										
			\$3,175,099.00	6.07 %	\$3,367,701.20	6.07 %	\$3,513,941.05	10.67 %	\$3,703,000.00	16.63 %
BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)										
			\$3,315,099.00	7.32 %	\$3,557,701.20	7.32 %	\$3,678,191.05	10.95 %	\$3,893,000.00	17.43 %
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)										
			\$3,315,099.00	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	\$4,003,000.00	20.75 %

NOTE : ALL BIDS REJECTED

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 00C514

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 006551

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Apr 23 2003

TITLE: US 101

REGION: 3

NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
AND REALIGNMENT
00C514

HWY: SR 101

1	\$3,251,943.91	BASE + A1	BRUCH & BRUCH CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1706 W HWY 101 PORT ANGELES, WA 983639458
2	\$3,285,358.05	BASE + A1	KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 PO BOX 158 MUKILTEO, WA 982750158
3	\$3,375,358.05	BASE + A2	KLB CONSTRUCTION INC. 3405 - 121ST ST SW LYNNWOOD WA 98037-1549 PO BOX 158 MUKILTEO, WA 982750158
4	\$3,524,776.00	BASE + A1	ROGNLIN'S, INC. 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 PO BOX 307 ABERDEEN, WA 985200078
5	\$3,557,701.20	BASE + A1	SCARSELLA BROS. INC. 19460 84TH AVE S KENT WA 98032-1240 PO BOX 68697 SEATTLE, WA 981680697
6	\$3,678,191.05	BASE + A1	DELHUR INDUSTRIES, INC. 4333 TUMWATER ACCESS RD 98363 PO BOX 1116 PORT ANGELES, WA 983620210

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 00C514

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 006551

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Apr 23 2003

TITLE: US 101

NOLAN CREEK VIC. BRIDGE
AND REALIGNMENT
00C514

REGION: 3

HWY: SR 101

7	\$3,893,000.00	BASE + A1	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT, WA 982011927
8	\$4,003,000.00	BASE + A2	WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1525 E MARINE VIEW DR EVERETT, WA 982011927

