

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/09/2014

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 11:34

PS&E JOB NO : 14W602 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008621 REGION NO : 0
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL4147
 HWY : SR 000
 TITLE : BLDG
 SB GEE CREEK SAFETY REST AREA
 IMPROVEMENTS
 14W602
 PROJECT : IM-0051(292)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK

BIDS OPENED ON : May 29 2014
 AWARDED ON : Jun 3 2014

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
FIVE RIVERS CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1331 BALTIMORE STREET LONGVIEW WA 986323208 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100216	CONWAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 414 PIONEER ST 98642-4512 PO BOX 303 RIDGEFIELD WA 986420303 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100424	TAPANI, INC. 1904 SE 6TH PLACE 98604-8300 BATTLE GROUND WA 986041900 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100273

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
BASE BID									
1	NEW RESTROOM BUILDING	L.S.			-11.48 %		-0.52 %		-1.39 %
			431,000.00	381,510.00	-49,490.00	428,750.00	-2,250.00	425,000.00	-6,000.00
2	REPLACED REST ROOM BUILDING	L.S.			16.10 %		23.66 %		15.59 %
			372,000.00	431,904.00	59,904.00	460,000.00	88,000.00	430,000.00	58,000.00
3	TRENCH SAFETY PROVISION	L.S.			-79.73 %		-33.33 %		-60.00 %
			3,000.00	608.00	-2,392.00	2,000.00	-1,000.00	1,200.00	-1,800.00
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$806,000.00</u>	<u>\$814,022.00</u>	1.00 %	<u>\$890,750.00</u>	10.51 %	<u>\$856,200.00</u>	6.23 %
ALTERNATE A1									
4	STORAGE AND CONCESSION	L.S.			66.37 %		-28.72 %		222.20 %
			70,143.00	116,698.00	46,555.00	50,000.00	-20,143.00	226,000.00	155,857.00
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		<u>\$70,143.00</u>	<u>\$116,698.00</u>	66.37 %	<u>\$50,000.00</u>	-28.72 %	<u>\$226,000.00</u>	222.20 %
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$806,000.00</u>	<u>\$814,022.00</u>	1.00 %	<u>\$890,750.00</u>	10.51 %	<u>\$856,200.00</u>	6.23 %
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$876,143.00</u>	<u>\$930,720.00</u>	6.23 %	<u>\$940,750.00</u>	7.37 %	<u>\$1,082,200.00</u>	23.52 %

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 04/09/2014

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 11:34

PS&E JOB NO : 14W602 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008621 REGION NO : 0
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL4147
 HWY : SR 000
 TITLE : BLDG
 SB GEE CREEK SAFETY REST AREA
 IMPROVEMENTS
 14W602
 PROJECT : IM-0051(292)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK

BIDS OPENED ON : May 29 2014
 AWARDED ON : Jun 3 2014

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 CAT WORKS, LLC
 22105B NE 72ND AVE
 BATTLE GROUND, WA 98604-9115
 YACOLT WA 986750299
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100783

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
BASE BID									
1	NEW RESTROOM BUILDING	L.S.	431,000.00	561,114.00	130,114.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
2	REPLACED REST ROOM BUILDING	L.S.	372,000.00	505,642.00	133,642.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
3	TRENCH SAFETY PROVISION	L.S.	3,000.00	312.00	-2,688.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$806,000.00</u>	<u>\$1,067,068.00</u>	<u>32.39 %</u>				%
ALTERNATE A1									
4	STORAGE AND CONCESSION	L.S.	70,143.00	140,229.00	70,086.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		<u>\$70,143.00</u>	<u>\$140,229.00</u>	<u>99.92 %</u>				
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$806,000.00</u>	<u>\$1,067,068.00</u>	<u>32.39 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$876,143.00</u>	<u>\$1,207,297.00</u>	<u>37.80 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 14W602

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 008621

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

May 29 2014

TITLE: BLDG

SB GEE CREEK SAFETY REST AREA
IMPROVEMENTS
14W602

REGION: 0

HWY: SR 000

1	BASE + A1	CAT WORKS, LLC 22105B NE 72ND AVE BATTLE GROUND, WA 98604-9115 PO BOX 206 YACOLT, WA 986750299
2	BASE + A1	TAPANI, INC. 1904 SE 6TH PLACE 98604-8300 PO BOX 1900 BATTLE GROUND, WA 986041900
3	BASE + A1	FIVE RIVERS CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1331 BALTIMORE STREET LONGVIEW, WA 986323208
4	BASE + A1	CONWAY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 414 PIONEER ST 98642-4512 PO BOX 303 RIDGEFIELD, WA 986420303